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Once upon a time, there was a young
man who was training to be a
warrior. The tests were going to take
place very soon and he wanted to be
prepared.

However, he felt very afraid and
believed that he was not capable of
being like others.  He believed that
everyone was better than him
because they had better swords,
better armor, and better shields.  And
he thought that he wasn't going to be
accepted on the team.

When he was on his way to the tests,
he saw something shining among the
bushes, it was a lamp that had a
message on it, when he rubbed the
lamp, between shine and dust, a
genie came out of it.
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Astonished, the young man
exclaimed: who are you?
I am the genie of the lamp, and today
is your lucky day my friend, since, to
free me, I will fulfi l l three wishes for
you, the genie told him.

The young man remembered all the
stories and tales about a magic lamp
that had a genie that granted wishes,
so he did not hesitate to ask the
genie for what he wanted at that
moment.

He asked the genie to take him
immediately to the place of testing,
and the genie fulfil led his wish, since
in less than a second they arrived at
the place.



And as his third and last wish he
asked the genie for a shining armor,
and his wish came true.

When the tests were about to begin,
the young man saw the other warriors
and said:
I will never be like them, I will never
be a warrior.

The worried genie asked him why he
thought that.

And the young man replied that he
thought that if he had shiny armor, a
nice sword and a shiny shield he
would feel capable of doing the
tests, but none of that worked, he felt
incapable of achieving it.



The genie told him that things were
not what made him brave and
capable of doing something, but that
it was his confidence and effort that
would help him become a warrior.  He
told him to have confidence in
himself and that he would achieve
everything.

The genius managed to encourage
the young man, and he bravely went
to perform his tests, remembering all
his training.  At the end of the tests,
the young man was chosen as the
new apprentice warrior, and from
then on he understood that it was not
the objects that made him brave, but
rather his self-confidence.


